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the k m i c  &d younga d o n  in the 
Soutkm No& Sea Be& rcsclltn from ths 
complex iacaactioo between extauion, salt 
tectonics, inversion, and subsiiacs tbat 
be~snintbclatc'RiagicaadcoarirmcdweU 
ink the Tatiary, lampretation of high- 
resolution 3-D seismic data. combinedwith 
2-D crosksection rtstorptiom and anv in- 
sights into salt kctonics dcrived from scakd 
analoa- d numerid-model exarimeatn. 
has pkmped a nevaluation ofihs dmC 
onmnt of salt-related shoctum h the ba- 
sh. sevaal key aspects of tbc develop- 
me& history can be wdl  explained using 
tk concepls of dispirit rise and fall and 
inversion-related diapiric rjuvenation as 
dwivcd from expcrimeotal data 

A wide variety of salt-related structures 
occur in the Southern Noah Sea Basin, in- 
cluding graben-diapir systems, salt walls, 

and salt swells and tmuehs. These srmc- 
olres, though physically &y diffesu~ have 
similardeveloament histories. Salt-nlslcd 
overburden s k  in fh basin an con- 
sided to result fmm thin-skinned. gmv- 
itydiven dsfmmatim that was nspoasible 
for triggering and contmlhq graben and 
diapir growth and for thc selective later in- 
version of some dIapim. A d d i t i d  s ~ -  
turcs wcn crated by bending and wnical 
movements aasociatcd with extensionally 
driven diapiric collapse. T k  developmcot 
of shucturrs developed as a simple nae- 
tion to the thin-skinned extension and sub 
seqouu w n ~ d o n  of the we*. 
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